Item 4Cvi. BCWMC 6-18-20

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

200 South Sixth Street, Suite 470 Minneapolis, MN 55402

(612) 337-9300 41-1225694 May 29, 2020 Statement No. 155031

Bassett Creek Water Management Commission

Laura Jester

Bassett Creek Watershed 16145 Hillcrest Lane Eden Prairie, MN 55346

Through April 30, 2020

BA295-00001

General

2,975.05

Total Current Billing:

2,975.05

I declare, under penalty of law, that this accound claim or demand is just and correguland that no part of it has been paid

Signature of Claimant

Page: 1

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

200 South Sixth Street, Suite 470 Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water Laura Jester

April 30, 2020

BA295-00001

General

Through April 30, 2020 For All Legal Services As	Hours	Amount		
4/2/2020 D	ATC	Review updated River Watch agreement with Hennepin County; emails and phone call with L Jester regarding same	0.40	79.60
4/3/2020 D	ATC	Additional emails related to Dominium project with L Jester and Plymouth staff regarding original city agreement and next steps related to same	0.30	59.70
4/6/2020 D	OTA	Emails with Dominium's attorneys and L Jester regarding updated CICA language and future calls, next steps	0.10	19.90
4/7/2020 D	OTA	Call with L Jester regarding Dominium's recent revisions to agreement and update regarding project, timelines, engineering review; conference call with attorneys representing Dominium regarding underlying issues, project components, agreement language; emails with C Labounty regarding same; review preliminary plat; review other project info and diagrams; emails with K Chandler regarding matter	2.90	577.10
4/8/2020 D	OTA	Additional work and revisions to CICA following recent dialogue with staff, Barr Engineering, and attorneys for Dominium; emails with Dominium attorneys regarding issues and agreement language; emails with Plymouth staff; emails with L Jester and Barr Engineering staff	3.10	616.90
4/8/2020 S	SJS	Telephone conference with D Anderson regarding providin access to not public data to committee members	g0.25	49.75
4/9/2020 D	ATC	Additional work on capital improvement project agreement; additional emails with Dominium attorneys related to same; discuss and work on holdback language and other issues related to agreement	0.90	179.10
4/10/2020 D	OTA	Emails with Dominium attorneys and emails and phone call with L Jester regarding agreement for capital improvement project	0.30	59.70
4/14/2020 D	ATC	Additional updates and language to finalize CICA with Dominium ahead of meeting; emails with Dominium attorneys and L Jester regarding same	0.50	99.50

Page: 2

Kennedy & Graven, Chartered

200 South Sixth Street, Suite 470 Minneapolis, MN 55402

Bassett Creek Water Laura Jester

April 30, 2020

4/14/2020	DTA	Emails with L Jester and engineers regarding critical sector work; review other watershed docs and determine how to handle determinations; phone call with L Jester regarding same; review and revise policy docs provided by L Jester	1.00	199.00
4/15/2020	DTA	Emails with L Jester and Dominium attorneys regarding finalized version of agreement ahead of tomorrow's meeting	0.20	39.80
4/16/2020	DTA	Review of Dawn Pape agreement for educational services and review of agreement with Restoration Services, Inc. fo CLP removal; emails with L Jester regarding same		99.50
4/16/2020	DTA	Review meeting agenda and packet materials ahead of monthly meeting; attend monthly meeting via Webex	3.00	597.00
4/20/2020	DTA	Begin finalizing insurance renewal application docs; emails with L Jester regarding same	0.60	119.40
4/22/2020	DTA	Review grant agreement for WOMP2 activities with Met Council; emails with L Jester regarding same	0.70	139.30
4/27/2020	DTA	Emails with North Risk Partners regarding insurance application	0.10	19.90
4/30/2020	DTA	Emails with L Jester regarding data practices policy and Dominium agreements	0.10	19.90
		Total Services:	\$	2,975.05

Total Services and Disbursements: \$ 2,975.05